From: WS

To: Kellie Perkins

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Past Due Permit Renewal
Date: Wednesday, May 26, 2021 11:25:57 AM
Hello Kellig,

It was a pleasure speaking with you yesterday - I no longer want this permit and | appreciate your time -

Thank you and look forward to continuing to work with you on my existing permits and new permits in the near
future!

Sent from my iPhone

> On May 25, 2021, at 1:18 PM, Kellie Perkins <KPERKINS@odot.org> wrote:

>

> Waylon,

>

> Per our conversation, below are the latitude and longitude for Reg # 14454. If you no longer want to keep this
permit please respond back stating so. | have also attached a photo of the permanent marker location.

> Latitude: 34.775

> Longitude: -98.31062

>

> Kellie Perkins

> Administrative Programs Officer |1

> QOutdoor Advertising Control Branch

> Phone: (405) 521-3005

> Fax: (405) 522-0386

>

> Oklahoma Department of Transportation

> Right-of-Way & Utility Division

> 200 NE 21 Street Room 2 A-1

> Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 73105

>

>

>

> This e-mail is covered by the Electronic Communications Act and may be legally privileged. The information
contained in this e-mail is intended for the use of the individual or the entity named above. If the reader of this
message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and destroy the original message.

> From: W S <wayward2day@hotmail.com>

> Sent: Wednesday, April 14, 2021 4:00 PM

> To: Kellie Perkins <KPERKINS@ODOT.ORG>

> Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Past Due Permit Renewal

>

> Ok and that’s for the other sign on the West side of 1-44 the other permit you said isn’t due until March 2022
>

> Sent from my iPhone

>

>> On Apr 14, 2021, at 3:48 PM, Kellie Perkins <KPERKINS@odot.org> wrote:
>>


mailto:wayward2day@hotmail.com
mailto:KPERKINS@ODOT.ORG

>> Your other permit for Reg # 15239 is not due until 3/31/2022 so | would not be able to post the money but | will
send you an invoice next year.

>>

>> Kellie Perkins

>> Administrative Programs Officer Il

>> Qutdoor Advertising Control Branch

>> Phone: (405) 521-3005

>> Fax: (405) 522-0386

>>

>> Oklahoma Department of Transportation

>> Right-of-Way & Utility Division

>> 200 NE 21 Street Room 2 A-1

>> Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 73105

>>

>>

>>

>> This e-mail is covered by the Electronic Communications Act and may be legally privileged. The information
contained in this e-mail is intended for the use of the individual or the entity named above. If the reader of this
message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and destroy the original message.

>>

>> From: W S <wayward2day@hotmail.com>

>> Sent: Wednesday, April 14, 2021 3:35 PM

>> To: Kellie Perkins <KPERKINS@ODOT.ORG>

>> Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Past Due Permit Renewal

>>

>> Hello Kellie,

>>

>> Thank you for the reminder - Also when is my other permit due - | can send in both at the same time.

>>

>> Sent from my iPhone

>>

>>>> 0On Apr 14, 2021, at 3:17 PM, Kellie Perkins <KPERKINS@odot.org> wrote:

>>>

>>> Good Afternoon,

>>>

>>> Please see the attached past due permit renewal invoice and photo of the sign for registration # 14454. The
$20.00 fee was due at the end of March and is now past due please remit payment to this office as soon as possible.
If you have any questions please let me know.

>>>

>>> Kellie Perkins

>>> Administrative Programs Officer Il

>>> Qutdoor Advertising Control Branch

>>> Phone: (405) 521-3005

>>> Fax: (405) 522-0386

>>>

>>> Oklahoma Department of Transportation Right-of-Way & Utility Division

>>> 200 NE 21 Street Room 2 A-1

>>> Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 73105

>>>

>>> [cid:image003.png@01D73141.43AF82D0]

>>>

>>> This e-mail is covered by the Electronic Communications Act and may be legally privileged. The information
contained in this e-mail is intended for the use of the individual or the entity named above. If the reader of this



message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and destroy the original message.

>>>

>>>
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